
Long-term Dental Implant Success Rates

Dental implant procedures have evolved markedly over the last 
decades. This treatment modality has become a daily routine in our 
practice. With experience dating back to the mid-1980s, we are able 
to provide implant surgery care ranging from single-tooth replacement 
to full arch restorations. We continue to be proud of our ability to offer 
a team approach for our patients. This allows delivery of state of the art 
surgical treatment in combination with restorative care being delivered in 
the patient’s existing dental practice. With this team approach, patients 
receive both a comprehensive treatment plan, surgical and restorative 
care customized for their specific situation, and a scenario where long-
term follow-up and care is rendered in the practice where they have 
been comfortable in the past.

We currently offer implant treatment utilizing several of the most highly 
respected implant systems in the world. We have intentionally relied 
on implant systems that will continue to provide support in the future, 
and deliver product offerings based on sound research. With this as a 
foundation, we are able to offer your patient the expectation of long-
term success rates in the mid 90% range over decades.

In our practice, we pride ourselves on communication with the 
restorative dental office. Through our implant coordinators, we have 
enhanced our ability to provide excellent communication with the 
patient. Each office location has a dedicated implant coordinator who 
is both experienced in implant care, and focused on excellent customer 
service for implant patients.

We value the trust shown in our practice in allowing us to care for your 
patients with dental implant needs. Together, we can provide care for 
your patients at the highest level.
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